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Samarth Rastogi Akshit Sogani

RE: Tax Invoices

Approved

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Friday, December 6, 2024 6:11 PM

To: Samarth Rastogi <samarth.rastogi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Tax Invoices

Hi Samarth,
Need single vendor approval for IPO Video Mixing & Editing Services.

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Accounts AdKo <accounts@adko.in>
Sent: 06 December 2024 17:25

To: Snehal Jadhav <snehal.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: RISHI UDAPURKAR <rishi@adko.in>; Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Tax Invoices

Hi Snehal,

Please find the Tax Invoices for TFS IPO Video and Voiceover attached below.

Thanks & Regards,
Accounts Department




