From: mohammed hussain <mhbrother62@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 5, 2024 2:15 PM
To: Mahadev Badiger

Cc: Nashid Ahmed

Subject: Re: gnt required.
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Dear sir

Please find the rate for your reference
Trolly wheel 4" ( Noyalon ) @ 1050/-
Regards

Mohammed Hussain Bros

NO 23 EV LANE SP ROAD CROSS BANGALORE 560 002

On Mon, 4 Mar, 2024, 11:04 am Mahadev Badiger, <mahadev.badiger@blrlounge.in> wrote:
Dear sir,

Kindly send us quotation for below the materials,
1, Trolly wheel 4" ( Noyalon )

Regards,

Mahadev Badiger,

Asst Manager - Maintenance

BLR Lounge Services Pvt Ltd

Room # 20 1st Floor Alpha 3 Building,
Kempegowda International Airport, KIAL Road,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, Karanataka 560300.
M: 9538452406

www.travelfoodservices.com




