Trupti Dalvi

From: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh

Sent: 05 October 2024 18:04

To: Trupti Dalvi

Subject: Fw: NT WORK Trivandrum

Attachments: Pl.pdf; 3 NT BILLING (1).xlsx; NT ITEM MEASUREMENT SIGNED COPY (1).pdf

It's for trv international lounge.

Regards
Ebrahim

Get Outlook for Android

From: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>
Sent: Saturday, October 5, 2024 12:48:38 PM

To: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Fw: NT WORK Trivandrum

Hi trupti,
Kindly raise pr of same.

Regards
Ebrahim

Get Outlook for Android

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, October 5, 2024 12:15:55 PM

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>; Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: NT WORK Trivandrum

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear All,

As per PI approval for Ebrahim sir please confirm and share the work order

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.
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On Sat, Oct 5, 2024 at 11:59 AM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia(@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

Find Attached Supporting document please Check.

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,

Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,
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On Sat, Oct 5, 2024 at 11:55 AM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,



Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.

Shan
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Date: Thu, Oct 3, 2024 at 6:24 PM

Subject: NT WORK Trivandrum

To: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: <urmila.jadhav(@travelfoodservices.com>, Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>, Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Dear sir

I have received 3 work orders Against Nt items But now As for site Situation we are completed in one po less than work order Amount & Another two work has completed greater than work order Amount. Therefore I requested
you to please check and Approved for the work order

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.

Shan

lenterprises|
NTERI
XTERI

I OR
E oRrR




