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Samarjit Pani Akshit Sogani; Chetan Bobade ~

Re: Single vendor form approval
@ You replied to this message on 04-07-2024 15:59.

Approved. Please share the contract with Akshay and close ASAP

Best Regards
Samarjit Pani (he/him)
GM, Marketing, Travel Food Services

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 4, 2024 3:42:50 PM

To: Samarjit Pani <samariit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>
Ce: Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Single vendor form approval

Hi Samarji,
Need single vendor approval for Adko for Adani & 080 Social Media page.

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Accounts AdKo <accounts@adko.in>
Sent: 04 July 2024 14:31
To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>; Snehal Jadhav <snehal.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Ce: rishi@adko.in

Subject: Tax Invoices





