[bookmark: _GoBack][image: ]
image1.png
o Samarjit Pani Akshit Sogani
4

§ .
\ Re: Tax Invoices

@ If there are problems with how this message is displayed, click here to view it in a web browser.

Ok, but is their contract done?

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 03 September 2024 12:19

To: Samarjit Pani <samariit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Tax Invoices

Need Single vendor approval for 080 & Adani Lounge page for Adko for month for Sep 2024.

From: Accounts AdKo <accounts@adko.in>
Sent: 02 September 2024 17:54
To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>; Snehal Jadhav <snehal.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Ce: RISHI UDAPURKAR <rishi@adko.in>

Subject: Tax Invoices

Hi,

Please find the Tax Invoices for the following:

1. Tax Invoice 24-RIOSEP-08 for 080 Lounge
2. Tax Invoice 24-RIOSEP-09 for Adani Lounge




