Trupti Dalvi

From: Suraj Kumbhar

Sent: 01 June 2024 17:40

To: Sitaram Mistry

Cc: Shama Nair; Trupti Dalvi; Lovejot Sekhon; Akshay Sharma

Subject: FW: GWH_ PCS payment issue

Attachments: Re: FRESH AND EXHAUST MACHINE PICKUP FROM DELHI TO GUWAHATI AIRPORT ; RE: FRESH AND EXHAUST MACHINE PICKUP FROM DELHI TO GUWAHATI AIRPORT

Dear Sitaram,
Please share quotation with Trupti to process/ to create PR in SAFAL.

Regards,
Suraj Kumbhar

From: Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 31 May 2024 12:43

To: Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: GWH_ PCS payment issue

Dear Suraj,
As discussed, please refer the attached mail of
1) Approval
2) Payment follow-up being made by PCS courier

Thanks & Regards,
Sitaram K. Mistry
+91 9082923475



