Sowri Raja

From: Karthick K

Sent: 03 January 2025 12:01

To: Sowri Raja

Subject: RE: QUOTATION FOR ICE CRUSHER MACHINE

Please proceed further...

Regards,
Karthick

From: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 03 January 2025 12:00

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: QUOTATION FOR ICE CRUSHER MACHINE

Hi Sir
Request your approval on new ice crusher machine for martini lounge.
The total cost is Rs 5500/- +GST

Regards,

Sowri Raja

Travel Food Services Ltd.
+91 9884054540

From: RELIABLE ENGG SERVICES RES <reliableengineering2016@gmail.com>
Sent: 03 January 2025 09:38

To: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: QUOTATION FOR ICE CRUSHER MACHINE




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

DEAR SIR,

KINDLY FIND THE ATTACHMENT,

Thanks & Regards 25

R.Kameshwaran.
Manager
(Production & Product Development)

Mobil:7299073538



