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Samarjit Pani Akshit Sogani

Re: Single vendor approval.

Approved
With Regards
Samarjit Pani
(he/him)
GM, Marketing
safe space z
e

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 01 July 2024 15:56

To: Samarjit Pani <samariit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Single vendor approval.

Hi Samarji,

As discussed with Chetan, need single vendor approval for Priya Graphics for May-June work.

Please revert for any clarification

Thank you
Akshit Sogani

From: Priya Raj <priyaraj1627 @gmail.com>
Sent: 01 July 2024 15:45

To: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Priya Invoice - May-June Work.pdf




