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Ajit Singh

From: Rupali Pol
Sent: Tuesday, November 5, 2024 6:49 AM
To: Ajit Singh
Subject: RE: WOW MOMO INVOICE FOR APPROVAL || KOL/TI/25/008058

Approved. 
 

From: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>  
Sent: 04 November 2024 15:29 
To: Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: WOW MOMO INVOICE FOR APPROVAL || KOL/TI/25/008058 
 
Dear Ma’am,  
 
Below are the wow Momo royalty invoice for approval.  
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Ma’am kindly approves the same  
 
Best Regards  
Ajit Singh  
Mob. No. 6263069383 
 


