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Invoices TFS

From: Anil Nayak
Sent: 23 July 2024 18:44
To: Invoices TFS
Cc: Parag Pandey
Subject: RE: Your Vi Postpaid Bill for July 2024
Attachments: vodafone-20240715.pdf

Dear Swalaram, 
 
This is Varun Sir's VI bill, so please submit it in SAFAL and process it for payment. 
 
 
Regards 
Anil 
 

From: Joy Silveira <joy.silveira@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 17 July 2024 11:49 
To: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Your Vi Postpaid Bill for July 2024 
 
Dear Team, 
 
Request your assistance in making the payment for the attached bill. The amount due- INR 8055/- 
 
 
Thanks and Regards 
 
Joy Silveira 
Manager – Director’s Office 
Mobile: 91525 54342 
K Hospitality Corp 
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