Nimisha Jadhav

From: Prabhat Kumar

Sent: 17 October 2024 14:12

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Binu Balachandran; Manmeet Singh Bakshi; Ajit Singh; Delhi Project; Shama Nair; Shadab Sukri

Subject: FW: Invoice for T1D Barricades & Dismantling work

Attachments: INV_TFS_176.pdf; INV_TFS_175.pdf; INV_TFS_171.pdf; INV_TFS_174.pdf; INV_TFS_173.pdf; INV_TFS_172.pdf
Nimisha,

Please process the attached invoices,the work is also completed:-

Amount(GST
P.O. Work Site Name Included) Invoice
TFSPL/PO/24- Burger Pizza Co T1 VV/24-
25/000753 Barricade Work Pier 41300 | 25/176
TFSPL/PO/24- Demolition & Removal of Debris of Masala Kitchen,Cafeccino,Healty eats & idli Masala Kitchen T1 VV/24-
25/000734 express Pier 88500 | 25/173
TFSPL/PO/24- VV/24-
25/000745 Barricade Work Cafeccinno T1 Pier 30680 | 25/171
TFSPL/PO/24- Masala Kitchen T1 VV/24-
25/000746 Barricade Work Pier 30040 | 25/172
TFSPL/PO/24- VV/24-
25/000747 Barricade Work Healty Eats 31860 | 25/174
TFSPL/PO/24- VV/24-
25/000748 Barricade Work Cafeccinno 41300 | 25/175

From: Prabhat Kumar

Sent: 05 September 2024 20:27

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh
<ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <delhi.project@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri




<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Invoice for T1D Barricades & Dismantling work

Share the P.O. of these attached work.

From: VIKAT VINAYAK <infovikatvinayak18 @gmail.com>

Sent: 05 September 2024 14:32

To: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Capex Purchase <capex.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Invoice for T1D Barricades & Dismantling work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please find the invoice for barricades and dismantling work at T1D for various locations. request you kindly release payments asap.

Best Regards

Jitendra Tiwari

Business Head

For VIKAT VINAYAK18 SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

+91 9871323798
: infovikatvinayak18@gmail.com
: www.vikatvinayak18.com




