Nimisha Jadhav

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Nimisha

Approved please process

Regards
Ajit Singh

Ajit Singh

25 October 2024 19:07

Nimisha Jadhav

Shadab Sukri; Prabhat Kumar; Binu Balachandran; Suraj Kumbhar; Anuj Dubey; Sabir Ali Shah; Shama Nair; Mrunal Joshi

FW: Shah Ent -RA bills of Budweiser T1.

Budwiser Bar Delhi Extra Work (..pdf; PO Extra Work Budwiser Bar Delhi.pdf; 32. Tax Invoice ( Extra Work Del Budwiser Bar ) Shah Enterprises
Mumbai.pdf

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, October 25, 2024 1:04 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran
<binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Shah Ent -RA bills of Budweiser T1.

Dear Ajit,

Kindly approve attached invoice to process further .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.



From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 25 October 2024 12:26

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu
Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: RA bills of Budweiser T1.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear All,

Find attached the tax invoice for extra work budwiser bar delhi so please check and process the same ASAP

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.
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On Mon, Jul 8, 2024 at 4:54 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team,
I am going to submit Proforma Invoice for Additional work budweiser bar delhi
so please check and process the work order

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,

Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,
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On Sat, Jul 6, 2024 at 11:59 AM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dera Team,

I have attached the final Tax Invoice for Budwiser Bar Delhi so please check and process the payment

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.

On Wed, May 8, 2024 at 5:00 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team,
It's been 20 days since the invoice was given. Please give some updates.Regarding The Payment
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Thanks & Regards

On Thu, Apr 25, 2024 at 6:28 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team,
Give me some update about the Invoice payment

Thanks & Regards
Modassir Wasim

On Sat, Apr 20, 2024 at 8:43 AM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team,
I have attached the Tax Invoice for Budwiser Bar Delhi so please check and process the Payment

Thanks & Regards
Modassir Wasim

On Fri, Apr 19, 2024 at 10:16 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

I will send it soon.

On Fri, Apr 19, 2024, 10:12 PM Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,



Kindly share tax invoice .

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2024 3:37 PM

To: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: RA bills of Budweiser T1.

Dear Sir,

Kindly share Tax invoice as per attached certified bill.



Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav

From: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 18, 2024 12:26 PM

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RA bills of Budweiser T1.

Sir,

Please find the file attached of RA bills of Budweiser T1.

From: Prabhat Kumar

Sent: 01 April 2024 16:19

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <delhi.project@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Lovejot
Sekhon Kcorp' <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Final Bill of Third wave Coffee T1 HVAC,Fire & Budweiser Civil work




Sir,

Please release the payment of Pioneer Project Solution:-

Third wave Coffee Delhi T1—HVAC & Fire.

Br//

Prabhat Kumar.

From: Prabhat Kumar

Sent: 26 February 2024 14:00

To: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Delhi Project <delhi.project@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Lovejot
Sekhon Kcorp' <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Final Bill of Third wave Coffee T1 HVAC,Fire & Budweiser Civil work

Sir,

Please find the final Bills of:-

Third wave Coffee Delhi T1—HVAC & Fire.

Budweiser Delhi T1—Civil.



Br//

Prabhat Kumar.



