Nimisha Jadhav

From: Prakash Mistry

Sent: 13 August 2024 14:29

To: Nimisha Jadhav; Finance Plugd

Cc: Khushbu Verma; Ritika; Shama Nair; sourabh@plugd.co.in; PLUGD
Subject: FW: LUCKNOW SEATING PAYMENT

Attachments: 2024-32 SEMOLINA LUCKNOW SEATING FINAL STAGE_Scan.pdf
Dear Nimisha,

Please proceed.

Thanks
Prakash Mistry

From: Finance Plugd <finance.plugd@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, August 9, 2024 5:47 PM

To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Ritika <ritika@plugd.co.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; sourabh@plugd.co.in;
PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: LUCKNOW SEATING PAYMENT

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Prakash,
Greetings from PLUGD.

We are sharing the pending and final stage invoice for Lucknow Dom Seating. Kindly get it processed.

On Thu, Mar 28, 2024 at 7:48 PM PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Nimisha,

Can we get a clear picture of the pending payments? When will we be receiving the payment against Lucknow Dom Seating- 3rd stage Invoice: PL-2023-61?
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Please treat this matter with urgency, as timely payment ensures the sustainability of our business relationships. I kindly request your prompt attention to this
matter.

Thank you for your cooperation and understanding. We look forward to your prompt response.
Warm regards,

Sourabh Khurana
Principal Architect

)

PLUGD

email: plugdworks@gmail.com
contact:

address:

On Tue, Mar 26, 2024 at 6:53 PM <sourabh@plugd.co.in> wrote:

Dear Prakash and Nimisha,
These invoices are from the 15th of Feb, after regress follow ups we still haven't received the full payment, third stage payment is still pending.

Urgently update us on the payment. Do call me if you require.

Regards,

Sourabh Khurana
Founder



o

PLUGD

email: plugdworks@gmail.com
contact: +91-99909 48535
+91-95206 61825
address: 1st Floor, C-78, Sector 88, Noida - 201305

On 18-03-2024 13:40, Nimisha Jadhav wrote:

Dear Team,

Already shared with finance team for payment process .

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav

From: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2024 1:17 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com>

Cc: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Ritika <ritika@plugd.co.in>; Sourabh Khurana <sourabh@plugd.co.in>; Shama Nair
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<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: LUCKNOW SEATING PAYMENT

Hi Nimisha,

Can you please check and revert.

Thanks

Prakash Mistry.

From: PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2024 1:08 PM

To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Ritika <ritika@plugd.co.in>; Sourabh Khurana <sourabh@plugd.co.in>; Finance Plugd
<finance.plugd@gmail.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: LUCKNOW SEATING PAYMENT

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Prakash,

We submitted advance-stage, second-stage, and third-stage bills for Dom Seating Lucknow, we only get GST amount for advance-stage and second-stage payments. The
third stage payment is still pending, kindly check and let us know - why is the third stage not cleared.
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These invoices were submitted on 15th Feb, it's been over a month and we are regressively following up with you but not getting clear answers or payments.

Kindly intervene and get back to us.

Regards,

Team PLUGD

PLUGD

email: plugdworks@gmail.com
contact: +91-99909 48535,
+91-99300 54118

address: 1st Floor, C-78, Sector-88, Noida - 201305



