Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 10 July 2024 17:11

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shadab Sukri; Delhi Project; Prabhat Kumar; Shama Nair
Subject: FW: Request for Review and Signature of Dilli Street RA-01 Bill
Attachments: RAO1 DILLI STREET.pdf; Tax invoice bill dilli street.pdf

Dear Nimisha
We can process the payment as per the attached sheet for Dilli Steet.

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2024 3:44 PM

To: Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Request for Review and Signature of Dilli Street RA-01 Bill

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good day.

As per your instructions, we have revised the documents accordingly. Please review the attached Tax Invoice Bill.
Should you have any questions or require further adjustments, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Looking forward to your confirmation.

Thanks & Regards,



Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises

Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.
Mobile : +91 9167593786 | 9820485192

On Wed, Jul 10, 2024 at 12:01 PM Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Kauim,

Pls revise RA Bill.

Regards

Ajeet

From: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 09 July 2024 18:01

To: Delhi Project <Delhi.Project@Travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Request for Review and Signature of Dilli Street RA-01 Bill

Dear Ajeet

Pls check and confirm



Regards

Ajit Singh

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2024 2:20 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Request for Review and Signature of Dilli Street RA-01 Bill

You don't often get email from info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Respected Sir,
Good day!

We have sent the Dilli Street RA-01 bill to you for review. Could you please review the bill and sign the hardcopy. Once signed, kindly send it
back to us so we can forward it to the accounts department.

Thank you for your cooperation.



Thanks & Regards,

Intercare Enterprise
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 98209 93221



