Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 27 May 2024 17:28

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Murchana Devi; PLUGD; Ritika; sourabh; Shama Nair; Finance Plugd
Subject: RE: TFS KOLKATA ABC BAR TAX INVOICES

Attachments: TFS KOLKATA ABC BAR TAX INVOICES

Dear Nimisha,
Please process

Regards
Shadab Sukri

From: Finance Plugd <finance.plugd@gmail.com>

Sent: 27 May 2024 04:19 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com>; Ritika <ritika@plugd.co.in>; sourabh <sourabh@plugd.co.in>; Shama
Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: TFS KOLKATA ABC BAR TAX INVOICES

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Shadab,

We are sharing the tax invoices for the Advance and Second stage bill for ABC bar Kolkata. Kindly get them processed. For your reference, we are sharing PO
too.

Regards,



)

PLUGD

email: finance.plugd@gmail.com
contact: +91-99909 48535,
+91-99300 54118
address: 1st Floor, C-78, Sector-88, Noida - 201305



