Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: 13 December 2024 01:10

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: sourabh@plugd.co.in; ritika@plugd.co.in; Stephen P; Mrunal Joshi; Pushpak Shewale; Finance Plugd; PLUGD

Subject: RE: Consultant for GOA MEET AND GREET- CITY SIDE & DOM ARI.

Attachments: 2024-64 TFSPL M&G GOA-D DOM ARI_SECOND STAGE_Scan.pdf; 2024-61 TFSPL M&G GOA-D CITY SIDE_ADVANCE STAGE_Scan.pdf;

2024-62 TFSPL M&G GOA-D CITY SIDE_SECOND STAGE_Scan.pdf; 2024-63 TFSPL M&G GOA-D DOM ARI_ADVANCE STAGE_Scan.pdf

Dear Nimisha,
Please process attached invoices.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2024 5:57 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: sourabh@plugd.co.in; ritika@plugd.co.in; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>;
Finance Plugd <finance.plugd@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Consultant for GOA MEET AND GREET- CITY SIDE & DOM ARI.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Shashank,
Greetings of the day.

We are sharing the invoices for the Meet and Greet at Dabolim Goa against Advance and Second stage for both the Kiosk.

Regards,



)

PLUGD
email: plugdworks(@gmail.com
contact:
address:

On Tue, Nov 12, 2024 at 12:23 PM Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Team,

PO has been released to you, we are awaiting for your acknowledge to Work order # TFSPL/PO/24-25/001142 &

#TFSPL/PO/24-25/001143 for Designer Scope of Goa meet & greet, WO Attached FYR.

Thanks & Regards,

Pushpak Shewale
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Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.
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Worli, Mumbai-400018.




