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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nazrul Mondal <nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>
Sent: 18 June 2024 13:28
To: Kaium; Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Anil Nayak; Parag Pandey; Amit Upadhyay; Shadab Sukri; Shama Nair
Subject: Re: Intercare -Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"
Attachments: image002.jpg

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Nimish,   
 
Please update on this.  
 
Regard,  
Nazrul 
 
On Tue, 18 Jun, 2024, 12:59 pm Kaium, <kaium@intercareenterprise.in> wrote: 

Dear Nimisha Ma’am, 

                                       Still pending the retention payment for Kolkata copper lounge project. 

  

Please release this payment asap do needful. 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Inter care Enterprise                                   

Sk Mahammad Kaium 
Project Organizer & Business partner 
M: 9930702814 , 9987921130 
www.indiamart.com/intercareenterprise 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been mov ed,  
renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

From: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2024 1:40 PM 
To: 'Nimisha Jadhav' <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Anil Nayak' <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Parag Pandey' <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' 
<nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>; 'Amit Upadhyay' <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Intercare -Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"  

  

Dear Nimisha Ma’am, 

                                       Still pending the retention payment for Kolkata copper lounge project, So please share the payment status . 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Inter care Enterprise                                   

Sk Mahammad Kaium 
Project Organizer & Business partner 
M: 9930702814 , 9987921130 
www.indiamart.com/intercareenterprise 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been mov ed,  
renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

From: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in>  
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2024 2:48 PM 
To: 'Nimisha Jadhav' <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Anil Nayak' <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Parag Pandey' <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' 
<nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>; 'Amit Upadhyay' <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Intercare -Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"  

  

Dear Ma’am, 
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                        Please find the attachment for revised working details of retention money for Copper lounge_Kolkata project. 

  

So, Please release the payment ASAP do needful. 

  

  

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Inter care Enterprise                                   

Sk Mahammad Kaium 
Project Organizer & Business partner 
M: 9930702814 , 9987921130 
www.indiamart.com/intercareenterprise 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been mov ed,  
renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2024 11:42 AM 
To: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in> 
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Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' 
<nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: Intercare -Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"  

  

Dear Sir, 

  

Please find below retention summary as per our records under TFSKPL entity . 

  

Kindly provide below retention table in your letter head for further approval . 

  

Document Date Document No. Remaining Amount External Document No. Vendor No. Description 
20-06-2023 GEN/23-24/00157 1,01,405.00 RETENTION-5% - FY-23-24/003 -2476 V0000156 Intercare Enterprise 
20-07-2023 GEN/23-24/00223 54,344.00 RETENTION-5% - FY-23-24/007 -2476 V0000156 Intercare Enterprise 
02-11-2023 GEN/23-24/00519 44,166.00 RETENTION-5% - FY-23-24/017 V0000156 Intercare Enterprise 

  1,99,915.00    

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Nimisha Jadhav. 
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From: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 14 May 2024 10:49 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' 
<nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Intercare -Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"  

  

Hi Nimisha, 

  

Please find below retention as per books. 

  

Entity- TFSKPL 

  

Document Date Document No. Remaining Amount External Document No. Vendor No. Description 
20-06-2023 GEN/23-24/00157 1,01,405.00 RETENTION-5% - FY-23-24/003 -2476 V0000156 Intercare Enterprise 
20-07-2023 GEN/23-24/00223 54,344.00 RETENTION-5% - FY-23-24/007 -2476 V0000156 Intercare Enterprise 
02-11-2023 GEN/23-24/00519 44,166.00 RETENTION-5% - FY-23-24/017 V0000156 Intercare Enterprise 

  1,99,915.00    

  

  

Regards, 

Anuj Dubey 
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From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 11 May 2024 15:24 
To: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' 
<nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com> 
Subject: FW: Intercare -Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"  

  

Dear Team, 

  

Please find attached working and retention letter for Kolkata copper lounge kindly review and confirm for approval to process further . 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Nimisha Jadhav. 

  

  

  

From: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in>  
Sent: 10 May 2024 21:39 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Islam Mondal' 
<nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com> 
Subject: Claim letter for retention money of " Copper lounge_Kolkata project"  



8

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Ma’am, 

                      Please find the attachment for Claim letter for retention money of “ Copper lounge_Kolkata project”  

  

Kindly release the payment asap do needful. 

  

  

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Inter care Enterprise                                   

Sk Mahammad Kaium 
Project Organizer & Business partner 
M: 9930702814 , 9987921130 



9

www.indiamart.com/intercareenterprise 
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been mov ed,  
renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  


