Nimisha Jadhav

From: Urmila Jadhav

Sent: 13 September 2024 12:55

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Sitaram Mistry; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp; Stephen P; Manish Shishodia; Jasmine Grover; Trupti Dalvi; Suraj Kumbhar; Shama Nair; Ameet.Koomar;
Akshay Sharma; Santosh Tambe; Ebrahim Anis Shaikh; Muskan Somani

Subject: RE: TVM_INTL Lounge_ MS Work _Final Bill

Attachments: Base Plate TVM puchase .jpg; Chequred Plate.jpg; Invoice 163-Additional MS Work .pdf; Material _Weight Slip 06.07.2024.jpg; Transport Bilty

- Material recieved at TVM.jpg; TVM_Additional MS_PO.pdf; TVM_Additional MS Work_Final Bill_Fdt_Working_Rv1.0_12.09.2024 xlsx;
TVM_Structure Work_JMR_Sign Off .pdf

Dear Nimisha Mam,

Attached Invoice checked, ok to proceed further.

Thanks & Regards,
Urmila Jadhav.

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 12 September 2024 19:29

To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Manish Shishodia
<manish@fallowdezience.com>; Jasmine Grover <jasmine@fallowdezience.com>; jasmine.grvr@gmail.com; Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>;
Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: TVM_INTL Lounge_ MS Work _Final Bill

Dear Urmila,

Kindly review and confirm for safal upload.



Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 12 September 2024 16:24

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sitaram Mistry <sitaram.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Manish Shishodia
<manish@fallowdezience.com>; Jasmine Grover <jasmine@fallowdezience.com>; jasmine.grvr@gmail.com; Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>;
Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: TVM_INTL Lounge_ MS Work _Final Bill

Dear Nimisha,

Approved , with in PO value, Kindly take forward for payment .

Regards
Santosh TAMBE

From: Manish Shishodia <manish@fallowdezience.com>

Sent: 12 September 2024 16:09

To: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Usheer Mohan <usheer@fallowdezience.com>; Pradeep Kumar <pradeep @fallowdezience.com>;
Jasmine Grover <jasmine@fallowdezience.com>; Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; FDT
Accounts <accounts@fallowdezience.com>; Khursheed Ahmad <khursheed @fallowdezience.com>

Subject: TVM_INTL Lounge_ MS Work _Final Bill

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please find a bill against additional MS work .



1. PO - Additional Item

2. Tax Invoice - Additional Work

3 Abstract - Additional MS Work
4. JMR- Signed Copy

5. Weight - Supporting Documents

Final Bill

PO :Semolina / PO / 24-25/ 000973

TVM _ INTL Lounge _Additional MS Work
S.N Item Description UoM Qty Rate Amount Approved Qty | App. Amount
1 Additional MS structure weight for TVD THE LOUNGE INTL KG 874.45 225 196751.25 874.45 196751.25
GST @18 % 35415.225 35415.225
Grand Total 232166.475 232166.475

Please make it approved within PO Value and do needful help .

Thanks & Regards ,

Manish Shishodia




-

elle



