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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Prakash Mistry
Sent: 25 June 2024 16:08
To: Nimisha Jadhav; htjagadish@gmail.com; Sarvesh Patil K-Corp
Cc: Khushbu Verma; Santosh Tambe
Subject: FW: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Structural design 
Attachments: Invoice for RA bill no. 1.pdf

Hi Nimisha,  
 
Please proceed with the Payment  
 
Thanks  
Prakash  
 

From: Jagadish H T <htjagadish@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 1:30 PM 
To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Mr. Prakash,  
 
As discussed please find attached our invoice for the design work done in Trivandrum airport International lounge. 
Please release the payment at the earliest. 
 
Regards 
Jagadish H T 
BSD STRUCTURAL CONSULTANTS 
 
On Sun, Jun 16, 2024 at 7:58 PM Jagadish H T <htjagadish@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Mr. Gurvinder / Mr. Prakash,  
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Please find attached the complete set of documents related to structural docket.  I am attaching them once again along with the balance drawings just in case 
any document is missing with you. 
 
1) Design sheet 
2) Staad model 
3) Structural drawings - 4 sheets 
4) Bill of materials - excel sheet 
 
For Gurvinder alone - the structural drawings in cad format.  Please do not release the cad drawings to site for execution. 
 
With this we have completed our scope of work for this project. 
 
Regards 
Jagadish H T 
BSD STRUCTURAL CONSULTANTS 
 
On Fri, Jun 14, 2024 at 3:58 PM Jagadish H T <htjagadish@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Gurvinder,  
 
Please attached revised drawing of the base plate layout.  The title sheet has been revised as per TFS requirement.  In addition, base plate and column detail 
has been added.  There is no change in the layout. 
 
Regards 
Jagadish H T 
BSD STRUCTURAL CONSULTANTS 
 
On Tue, Jun 11, 2024 at 7:20 PM Jagadish H T <htjagadish@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Gurvinder,  
 
Please find attached revised column beam layout based on the revised equipment shared with us. 
1)  A few columns have been shifted and the beam layout has been completely revised.  
2)  The RO plant and water tank has been moved to suit the existing beams.  We presume that the RO plant and water tank will be mounted directly on 
the chequered plate platform.  Please confirm 
3)  The extent of the chequered plate has been marked in the same drawing.  please confirm.  Hope access to go upto the platform has been looked into, as 
we will not be able to extend the chequered plate beyond that shown in the drawing.  The weight of chequered will go beyond our design loads if 
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extended.  So if you need to extend, a catwalk to the nearest ladder may do so.  Also please review the extent of chequered plate around the equipment and 
see if we can minimise the same. 
4) Please note that the beams in green and magenta colour are connected face to face while the orange colour beams are continuous at the bottom 
 
Please review the beam column layout and confirm for us to proceed with the design. 
 
Regards 
Jagadish H T 
BSD STRUCTURAL CONSULTANTS 
 
On Tue, Jun 11, 2024 at 3:19 PM Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in> wrote: 

Dear Jagadish, 

  

Please find attached the RCP cad file. 

  

Regards 

Gurvinder Singh 

  

From: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>  
Sent: 07 June 2024 15:41 
To: 'Prakash Mistry' <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Akshay Sharma' <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Shama Nair' <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; 'ankit@genarch.in' 
<ankit@genarch.in>; 'Khushbu Verma' <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Santosh Tambe' <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Genesis 
Arch' <navjot@genarch.in>; 'GAPL' <genarchpl@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 
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Dear Parkash, 

  

Please find attached rcp with HVAC units raf the same for the beam and column. 

Kindly share the same for structure. 

  

Regards 

Gurvinder Singh 

  

From: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>  
Sent: 06 June 2024 14:10 
To: 'Prakash Mistry' <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Akshay Sharma' <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Shama Nair' <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; 'ankit@genarch.in' 
<ankit@genarch.in>; 'Khushbu Verma' <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Santosh Tambe' <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Saeed 
Khan' <saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Genesis Arch' <navjot@genarch.in>; 'GAPL' <genarchpl@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

Dear Prakash, 

  

Please find attached the RCP cad file. 

  

Regards 
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Gurvinder Singh 

  

From: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 06 June 2024 12:21 
To: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in> 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; ankit@genarch.in; Khushbu Verma 
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan 
<saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Genesis Arch' <navjot@genarch.in>; 'GAPL' <genarchpl@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

Dear Gurvinder,  

  

Kindly change the kitchen layout as discussed and share the layout for approval.  

  

Thanks  

Prakash  

  

From: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>  
Sent: Thursday, June 6, 2024 12:10 PM 
To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; ankit@genarch.in; Khushbu Verma 
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan 
<saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Genesis Arch' <navjot@genarch.in>; 'GAPL' <genarchpl@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Prakash, 

  

Please find attached the revised Equipment layout.  

  

Regards 

Gurvinder Singh 

  

From: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 05 June 2024 11:47 
To: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>; 'Genesis Arch' <navjot@genarch.in> 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; ankit@genarch.in; Khushbu Verma 
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Saeed Khan 
<saeed.khan@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

Dear Gurvinder, 

Please note that removing under-counter chillers is not a viable solution. Kindly work with your kitchen consultants to provide us 
with a workable solution, as we have already provided our equipment requirements. 
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Thank you. 

Prakash Mistry 

  

From: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 4, 2024 6:44 PM 
To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; ankit@genarch.in; 'Genesis Arch' 
<navjot@genarch.in>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Prakash, 

  

As discussed on call today, we removed two under-counter chillers to achieve workable ht. for the Table Top Hot Plate, GN pan & induction near the live 
kitchen window. 

The revised layout and kitchen equipment list is attached for your approval. 

  

Regards 

Gurvinder Singh 

  



8

From: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>  
Sent: 30 May 2024 17:25 
To: 'Prakash Mistry' <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Akshay Sharma' <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; 'Shama Nair' <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; 'ankit@genarch.in' 
<ankit@genarch.in>; 'Genesis Arch' <navjot@genarch.in>; 'Khushbu Verma' <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Santosh Tambe' 
<santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

Dear Prakash, 

  

Please find attached the revised 3d views as per the feedback received. 

  

Regards 

Gurvinder Singh 

  

From: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 27 May 2024 13:00 
To: gurvinder@genarch.in; Genesis Arch <navjot@genarch.in>; ankit@genarch.in 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma 
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

Dear Gurvinder,  
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Based on my discussion with Navjot, revise 3d render to be shared on 29th May with revised comments given by Varun sir,  

  

Thanks  

Prakash Mistry  

  

From: Prakash Mistry  
Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2024 1:07 PM 
To: gurvinder@genarch.in; Genesis Arch <navjot@genarch.in>; ankit@genarch.in 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma 
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Trivandrum | international Lounge | Design Presentation 

  

Dear Gurvinder,  

  

The 3D render looks aesthetically pleasing.  

  

as previously specified, our budget is limited to 2 crores. However, based on the 3d design, it seems that we may exceed the 
budget. Kindly confirm this observation. 

  

and, as per our earlier discussion , it was agreed that the false ceiling should be partially open to align with the existing services in 
line with the airport ceiling. However, as per 3d render it is deemed necessary to modify the entire services before closing the 
ceiling – please check and confirm if this will be within budget.  
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Thank you,  

Prakash Mistry. 

  

  

From: Gurvinder <gurvinder@genarch.in>  
Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2024 12:32 PM 
To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Navjot' <navjot@genarch.in>; 'GAPL' <genarchpl@gmail.com>; 'ankit' 
<ankit@genarch.in> 
Subject: Trivandrum Lounge _Design Presentation 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Prakash, 

  

Please find attached the Design Presentation for Trivandrum Lounge. 

Kindly review and share your inputs. 
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Regards 

Gurvinder Singh 

  

 
 
 
--  
H T JAGADISH 

 
 
 
--  
H T JAGADISH 

 
 
 
--  
H T JAGADISH 

 
 
 
--  
H T JAGADISH 


