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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nimisha Jadhav
Sent: 16 October 2024 10:15
To: ARROW ELECTRICAL
Cc: Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar; Ranjandas S
Subject: FW: RA1 Bill for Electrical Work@ BLR lounge ph-2-T1
Attachments: RA 1 certified 151024.pdf; PurchaseOrderPrint8aa78637-6689-47e9-a195-0410f6eee35d.pdf

Dear Sir, 
 
Kindly share tax invoice as per attached certify bill. 
 
Please find billing address details for tax invoice . 
 

Sr 
No 

Name Of Company 
State 
Name 

Branch Name GST Number Nature of Location Detailed address of location 

1 Travel Food Services Private Limited  Karnataka BLR- T1 29AADCB2762L1ZE Lounge & Transit Hotel 
Terminal 1, Administration Block, Kempegowda International Airport, Bengaluru, Bengaluru 
Urban, Karnataka, 560300 

 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Nimisha Jadhav. 
 

s S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>  
Sent: 15 October 2024 20:57 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; santosh khake (project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com) <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com> 
Subject: Fw: RA1 Bill for Electrical Work@ BLR lounge ph-2-T1 
 
 
Resending 
Get Outlook for Android 
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From: Ranjandas S 
Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 1:02:54 PM 
To: Nimish Shah <nimish.shah@meptekconsultants.com>; ARROW ELECTRICAL <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com> 
Cc: Santosh Khake <khakesantosh10@gmail.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: RA1 Bill for Electrical Work@ BLR lounge ph-2-T1  
  
Dear Nimisha, 
  
Please find attached herewith the RA-1 of Arrow electrical.  
  
  
Dear Santosh, 
  
Please accept the bill and submit the tax invoice for approval. 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
  

From: ARROW ELECTRICAL <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 12 October 2024 1:23 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Cc: Santosh Khake <khakesantosh10@gmail.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RA1 Bill for Electrical Work@ BLR lounge ph-2-T1 
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
  
Dear sir,  
Please find the attached RA-1 Bill and supporting documents for your review.  
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Thanks & Regards, 
ARROW Electrical's 
  
Santosh Khake 
9920431850 
  


