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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh
Sent: 26 September 2024 17:38
To: Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Shadab Sukri; Prabhat Kumar; Delhi Project
Subject: FW: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport
Attachments: Tax Invoice Fire Work @Subway T1 IGI airport.pdf; Tax Invoice HVAC Work @Subway T1 IGI airport.pdf

Hi Nimisha 
 
Approved 70% for Fire and HVAC work 
 
Regards 
Ajit Singh 
 

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2024 5:23 PM 
To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport 
 
Dear Ajit, 
 
Kindly review and approve attached  invoice for safal upload. 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Nimisha Jadhav. 
 
 
 

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008@gmail.com>  
Sent: 26 September 2024 16:04 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
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Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Mam,  
 
Kindly find the attached Tax invoice of HVAC & Fire Work For Subway @T1 IGI airport Delhi. 
 

THANKS & REGARDS 

KIRAN GUPTA 

  

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION 

  

OFFICE VENUE – 20/567 , 3r d Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373 

Ext – 31  

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL 

 
On Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 4:01 PM <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com> wrote: 
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REGARDS 

PREMKANT RAJPOOT 

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION    

CIN NO-U74999DL2018PTC333864 

OFFICE VENUE -  41/1407 ,  2N D  FLOOR DDA  FLAT 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600  9871770191 

Ext – 31 

Mail id –anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com 

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com 

  

From: account.anjle@gmail.com <account.anjle@gmail.com>  
Sent: 12 September 2024 04:08 PM 
To: 'Ajit Singh' <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Shadab Sukri' <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; 'PREMKANT RAJPOOT' <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; 'Amit Upadhyay' 
<amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Shama Nair' <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RA1 Running bill of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport 

  

Dear Ajit Ji, 

  

Kindly find the attached RA1 Running bill of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport, kindly check and send the approval so that we can raise the 
Tax Invoice . 
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Also The final bill or measurement for Budweiser is still pending approval, and we urgently need the funds. Without the funds, we cannot complete the 
Subway outlet. Kindly prioritize this matter and arrange a meeting to check  the measurements. 

  

Please treat this as a priority. 

  

REGARDS 

Priyanka(ADMIN AND ACCOUNTS  MANAGER) 

  

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  15th YEAR COMPLETION 

  

OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2ND FLOOR DDA  FLAT 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373 

Ext – 31 

Mail id –anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com 

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL ,   
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--  

THANKS & REGARDS 

KIRAN GUPTA 

  

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION 

  

OFFICE VENUE – 20/567 , 3r d Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373 

Ext – 31  

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL 


