Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 10 October 2024 21:10

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Ajit Singh; PREMKANT RAJPOOT; Amit Upadhyay; Shama Nair; Anjle Security; ANJLE OFFICE
Subject: RE: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport

Attachments: Re: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport

Dear Nimisha,
Please process

Regards
Shadab Sukri

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Sent: 10 October 2024 06:13 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>;
Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Kindly find the attached Tax invoice of HVAC Work (Extra Work) For Subway @T1 IGI airport Delhi
and also find the attached MB sheet Signed by Ajit Sir.

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA



FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL

On Wed, Oct 9, 2024 at 5:35 PM Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Premkant,

Please routed through Ajit

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Sent: 09 October 2024 02:08 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mam,

Kindly find the attached Tax invoice of HVAC Work (Extra Work) For Subway @T1 IGI airport Delhi.

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL

On Fri, Oct 4, 2024 at 11:46 AM <account.anjle@gmail.com> wrote:




Dear Nimisha Ji,

We are asking about below submitted Invoices , Where are the payments?

Please tell us.
1. Samba Square submitted Tax Invoice - Payment Pending
2. Taco Bell final Tax Invoice. — Payment Pending.
3. Pizza Hut BTU Meter Bill Submitted — Payment Pending
4. Dry House Invoice Submitted — Payment Pending
REGARDS

Priyanka(ADMIN AND ACCOUNTS MANAGER)

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 15' YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2"° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31



Mail id —anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL ,

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 04 October 2024 11:43

To: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport

Dear Sir,

Invoice uploaded on safal for payment process .

INVOICE

= INWIHCE TRANSACTION PRWIRCE THYDICE FO SUPPLIER
IRVOICE N SUBMISSION PO N PO DAY SUPPLIER MAME ENTITY NAM
R0 DATE DA:: TYPE ATTACHMENT AMOUNT i Stk CATEGORY COOE SEEL -
AMP-TS0SS  26-Sep-Hidd ¥)-Sep-r0ld with PO 4TS ITS.E0  TFSPLPOZ4-2500007%  12-Apr-2024 Capex NSO  RVII2413233 ANJLE BEP PROJECTS PYTLTD TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES FREVATE LIMITE
AMP-J50E  26-Sep-H0dd IT-Sap. BOE with PO 130,075.62 . TRAFLIPOZ- D001 15-Jan. 20204 Cagex N33  RVII1353]  ANKE MEP PROJECTS PVTLID TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITE

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav.



From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Sent: 26 September 2024 16:04

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Tax Invoice of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mam,

Kindly find the attached Tax invoice of HVAC & Fire Work For Subway @T1 IGI airport Delhi.

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT



NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373
Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL

On Thu, Sep 26, 2024 at 4:01 PM <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com> wrote:

REGARDS
PREMKANT RAJPOOT
FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14th YEAR COMPLETION

CIN NO-U74999DL2018PT(C333864

OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2N> FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600 9871770191

Ext - 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com




From: account.anjle@gmail.com <account.anjle@gmail.com>

Sent: 12 September 2024 04:08 PM

To: 'Ajit Singh' <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: 'Shadab Sukri' <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; 'PREMKANT RAJPOOT' <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; 'Amit Upadhyay'
<amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Shama Nair' <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RA1 Running bill of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport

Dear Ajit Ji,

Kindly find the attached RA1 Running bill of HVAC & Fire Work for Subway @T1 IGI Airport, kindly check and send the approval so that we can raise
the Tax Invoice .

Also The final bill or measurement for Budweiser is still pending approval, and we urgently need the funds. Without the funds, we cannot complete the
Subway outlet. Kindly prioritize this matter and arrange a meeting to check the measurements.

Please treat this as a priority.

REGARDS

Priyanka(ADMIN AND ACCOUNTS MANAGER)

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 15" YEAR COMPLETION




OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2"° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373
Ext — 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@agmail.com, anjlesecurity@agmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL ,

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext - 31



COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL

THANKS & REGARDS

KIRAN GUPTA
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FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3" Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL
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