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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S
Sent: 22 October 2024 12:28
To: ANJLE OFFICE
Cc: PREMKANT RAJPOOT; Anjle Security; Nimisha Jadhav; Suraj Kumbhar; Shama Nair
Subject: RE: Running bill for Domestic lounge
Attachments: Certified RA 1 FPS 000144.pdf; Certified RA-1 HVAC 000143.pdf; Kitchen hood 000230 certified invoice.pdf

Dear Kiran, 
 
Please find attached herewith the certified copy of the following bills: 
 

1) PO no.BLR/PO/24-25/000230 Kitchen hood installation Rs.40,000+GST 
2) PO No.BLR/PO/24-25/000144 FPS work RA-1- Rs.379,483+GST 
3) PO NO.BLR/PO/24-25/000143 HVAC WORK 

HVAC HIGH SIDE RS.1,475,650+GST 
HVAC LOW SIDE RS.1,628,515 +GST 
KITCHEN VENTILATION HIGH SIDE RS.331,500 +GST 
KITCHEN VENTILATION LOW SIDE RS.366,713 +GST 
 
 
Request to accept and raise the invoice with PO number on following address 
 

Sr 
No 

Name Of Company 
State 
Name 

Branch Name GST Number Nature of Location Detailed address of location 

1 Travel Food Services Private Limited  Karnataka BLR- T1 29AADCB2762L1ZE Lounge & Transit Hotel 
Terminal 1, Administration Block, Kempegowda International Airport, Bengaluru, Bengaluru 
Urban, Karnataka, 560300 

 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
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Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 
 

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2024 6:14 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Cc: PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Running bill for Domestic lounge 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir,  
 
Find the attached excel sheet . 
 

THANKS & REGARDS 

KIRAN GUPTA 

  

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION 

  

OFFICE VENUE – 20/567 , 3r d Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373 

Ext – 31  

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL 
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On Mon, Oct 21, 2024 at 4:19 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote: 

Dear Kiran, 

  

Few documents in Zip file is corrupt and not able to open. Please send in excel sheet and not in Zip 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
 
Ranjandas Shetty, 
Project Incharge, 
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited, 
Kempegowda International Airport, 
Devanahalli, Bengaluru, 
Karnataka 560300. ✆ +91 - 9663778877. 

  

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 19 October 2024 5:35 pm 
To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> 
Cc: PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com> 
Subject: Running bill for Domestic lounge 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
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Dear Sir,  

  

Kindly find the attached running bill for Domestic lounge @ Bangalore  

please review and share the confirmation, so that we can raise the GST invoice. 

  

  

  

--  

THANKS & REGARDS 

KIRAN GUPTA 

  

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION 

  

OFFICE VENUE – 20/567 , 3r d Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373 

Ext – 31  

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL 
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--  

THANKS & REGARDS 

KIRAN GUPTA 

  

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD  14th YEAR COMPLETION 

  

OFFICE VENUE – 20/567 , 3r d Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar 

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT 

NEW DELHI 110062   ,011-41401600,  9560072373 

Ext – 31  

COMPLETED SOLUTION – FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL 


