Nimisha Jadhav

From: Amol Dandekar

Sent: Wednesday, March 20, 2024 6:31 PM
To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shama Nair

Subject: RE: Whitewater -

Dear Nimisha

Approved from my side.
Thanks

Best regards

Amol Dandekar

From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: Wednesday, March 20, 2024 5:59 PM

To: Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Whitewater -

Dear Amol,

Kindly approve attached invoice to process further .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav



