Nimisha Jadhav

From: Khushbu Verma

Sent: Friday, February 16, 2024 12:11 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav; Suraj Kumbhar

Cc: Shama Nair; Akshay Sharma; Prakash Mistry; Irfan Sayed; PLUGD

Subject: FW: LUCKNOW DON SEATING BILLS

Attachments: 2023-59 SEMOLINA LUCKNOW SEATING ADVANCE_Scan.pdf; 2023-60 SEMOLINA LUCKNOW SEATING 2ND STAGE_Scan.pdf; 2023-61

SEMOLINA LUCKNOW SEATING 3RD STAGE_Scan.pdf

Dear Nimisha
Please find attached herewith tax invoices send by Plugd for food hall seating at Lucknow.
Kindly do the needful.

Regards
Khushbu

From: Finance Plugd <finance.plugd@gmail.com>

Sent: 15 February 2024 21:39

To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; PLUGD <plugdworks@gmail.com>; Ritika <ritika@plugd.co.in>; sourabh <sourabh@plugd.co.in>
Subject: LUCKNOW DON SEATING BILLS

Some people who received this message don't often get email from finance.plugd@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Prakash,

Greetings from PLUGD.
We are sending you the tax invoices of Ist- Kick off meeting, 2nd - concept stage and 3rd - Tender drawings and BOQ stage for Lucknow Seating (Semolina
Kitchen Pvt. Ltd.)



Request you kindly process the 2nd and 3rd stage bills at the earliest.

Regards,

Team Finance@PLUGD

)

PLUGD

email: finance.plugd@gmail.com
contact: +91-99909 48535,
+91-99300 54118
address: 1st Floor, C-78, Sector-88, Noida - 201305



