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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nimisha Jadhav
Sent: 18 May 2024 16:28
To: Khushbu Verma; acc1.rathiassociates@gmail.com
Cc: Suraj Kumbhar; Ashish Nagar; Shama Nair; Akshay Sharma; Prakash Mistry; acc1.rathiassociates@gmail.com
Subject: RE: Mumbai T2_AJ kitchen PI_Rathi Associates

Importance: High

Dear Khushbu , 
 
Kindly share Tax invoice . 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Nimisha Jadhav. 
 
 
 

From: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 18 May 2024 15:55 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; acc1.rathiassociates@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: Mumbai T2_AJ kitchen PI_Rathi Associates 
 
Dear Nimisha 
 
Please find attached herewith Proforma Invoice for AJ 1881 outlet at Mumbai T2 International. 
 
Also note that GFC drawing for all the packages have been received. 
 
Regards 
Khushbu  
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From: Accounts (Rathi Associates) <acc1.rathiassociates@gmail.com>  
Sent: 18 May 2024 12:11 
To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: 'Accounts (Rathi Associates)' <accounts@rathiassociates.com>; 'Rohan Rathi' <rohan@rathiassociates.com>; punita@rathiassociates.com 
Subject: RE: Wagamama Domestic and AJ kitchen PI 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Ashish and Kushbu, 
 
Please Find the attached  Proforma Invoice of the AJ Kitchen Please make the payment with GST and we will issue tax invoice for the same. 
 
We already raised the tax invoice for the 15% advance received along with the work order please make the GST payments as soon as possible. 
 
 
 
Regards, 
Vijay Kumar S  
Ext.No : 404 
 
 

 
 
The information contained in this electronic communication, as well as in any attachments, is privileged and confidential and intended solely for use by the addressee(s). Any other use, dissemination, or copying of this 
electronic communication is strictly prohibited and is an interference with Rathi Associates (RA) confidential business relationships. If you received this communication in error, please notify us immediately and permanently 
delete the original and any electronic or printed copies of this electronic communication. Finally, the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of any viruses. RA accepts no liability for any 
damage caused by any virus/errors transmitted by this email. 
 

 Some people who received this message don't often get email from acc1.rathiassociates@gmail.com. Learn why this is important  
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From: Punita (Rathi Associates) [mailto:punita@rathiassociates.com]  
Sent: 17 May 2024 18:05 
To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: acc1.rathiassociates@gmail.com; Accounts (Rathi Associates) <accounts@rathiassociates.com>; Rohan Rathi <rohan@rathiassociates.com> 
Subject: Wagamama Domestic and AJ kitchen PI 
 
Dear Khushbu/Ashish, 
  
As discussed, request you to do the necessary; 
  

 Please issue the PO for Wagamam- Domestic T2 Mumbai airport  
 We are raising the Performa invoice for AJ kitchen -75% against the PO (i.e. 25% for concept stage , 25% for Tender stage and 25% for GFC stage) 

  
@Vijay, 
Please raise the PI for AJ kitchen 75% against the work order. 
  
  
Regards, 
Punita Gopashetty 
Ext No. 406 

 
The information contained in this electronic communication, as well as in any attachments, is privileged and confidential and intended solely for use by the addressee(s). Any other use, dissemination, or copying of this 
electronic communication is strictly prohibited and is an interference with Rathi Associates (RA) confidential business relationships. If you received this communication in error, please notify us immediately and 
permanently delete the original and any electronic or printed copies of this electronic communication. Finally, the recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of any viruses. RA accepts no 
liability for any damage caused by any virus/errors transmitted by this email. 
  
  


