Nimisha Jadhav

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Nimisha,

Please proceed further..

Regards,
Karthick

Karthick K

Friday, April 5, 2024 2:13 PM

Nimisha Jadhav

Ajit Yadav

RE: Invoice for additional works Masala Kitchen

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 05 April 2024 12:25

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Invoice for additional works Masala Kitchen

Dear Karthick ,

For your review and approval .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav



From: satishchand g <saidesigns18@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, April 5, 2024 11:26 AM

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Invoice for additional works Masala Kitchen

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Nimisha,

Kindly see the invoice & supporting documents attached for additional works at Masala Kitchen chennai.
Any clarifications kindly call us.

Regard's

G.Satish Chand

Mob: 9710716352



