Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S

Sent: 25 June 2024 11:20

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shama Nair; info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com; Invoices TFS

Subject: RE: Final performa bill of Irish House BLR project

Attachments: invoice phe final.pdf; invoice.Civil & ID final.pdf; Irish house civil & ID final bill certified copy po no. 000560.pdf; Irish house PHE final bill

certified copy po no. 000645.pdf

Dear Nimisha,
Please ignore trial mail. Please find attached herewith tax invoice of PHE & ID works final bills.
Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Ranjandas S

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2024 11:14 am

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Final performa bill of Irish House BLR project

Dear Nimisha,
Please find attached herewith Final bill tax invoice of Irish house to process further.

Thanks & Regards,



Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Ranjandas S

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2024 11:55 am

To: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Final performa bill of Irish House BLR project

Dear Kaium,

Please find attached herewith certified copy of final for your acceptance. Request to submit the invoices along with the following documents:
1) Civil and interior all As built drawing
2) PHE As built drawing
3) Fire rated certificate for all materials
4) Water meter test certificate
5) As built drawing of MS truss
6) Plumbing line pressure test report

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in>

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2024 12:21 PM

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Amol Dandekar <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Final performa bill of Irish House BLR project




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find the attachment for the revised final performa bill of civil & interior work for said project.
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Inter care Enterprise
Sk Mahammad Kaium

Project Organizer & Business partner
M: 9930702814 , 9987921130

www.indiamart.com/intercareenterprise

From: Kaium <kaium@intercareenterprise.in>

Sent: Wednesday, March 6, 2024 12:51 PM

To: BLR Ranjandas S (Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in) <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Cc: 'Amol Dandekar' <amol.dandekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair (shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com) <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Final performa bill of Irish House BLR project

Dear Sir,
Please find the attachment for get the final performa bill of said project.
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Inter care Enterprise
Sk Mahammad Kaium

Project Organizer & Business partner
M: 9930702814 , 9987921130

www.indiamart.com/intercareenterprise




