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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Irfan Sayed
Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 9:11 AM
To: Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Urmila Jadhav; Suraj Kumbhar; Divesh Tripathi; Antim Sharma; Trupti Dalvi; Akshay Sharma; Shama Nair
Subject: FW: FW: Signage Invoices - LKO-T3 Outlets
Attachments: CAFECCINO 017.jpg; FLYING BITES B01 021.jpg; BOARDING BITES 016.jpg; FLYING BITES A09 020.jpg; AJ KITCHEN 018.jpg; SHAWARMA 

022.jpg; SWAMY 015.jpg

Importance: High

Dear Nimisha 
 
Please find attached invoices for LKO-T3 signage’s work done for below mentioned outlets. 
 

 Cafeccino – D50 
 Flying Bites – B01 
 Flying Bites – A09 
 AJ Kitchens – D16 
 Swamy’s – D09 
 Shawarma, Burger & Masala Kitchens 

 
Request you to only book the invoices in system, payment release I will confirm in coming week. 
 
Regards, 
Irfan 
 

From: Prifar Signs <prifarsignslucknow@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 7:01 AM 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: Signage Invoices - LKO-T3 Outlets 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
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Dear Irfan,  
 
 
Changes made in gst details , plz check and confirm 
 
Thanks and regards 
Priya 
 
On Wed, Mar 27, 2024 at 10:24 PM Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Dear Priya 

  

Please revised the invoice and mentioned billing address as attached GST certificate for further processing. 

  

Regards, 

Irfan 

  

  

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2024 9:25 PM 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Signage Invoices - LKO-T3 Outlets 

  

Dear Irfan, 
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Kindly revised all tax invoice with Lucknow billing address .  

  

GST attached for reference . 

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Nimisha Jadhav 

  

  

  

From: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2024 2:57 PM 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: Signage Invoices - LKO-T3 Outlets 

  

Dear Nimisha 

  

Please check and confirm for further processing.. 

  

Regards, 



4

Irfan 

  

  

From: Prifar Signs <prifarsignslucknow@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2024 10:12 AM 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: Signage Invoices - LKO-T3 Outlets 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Irfan,  

  

Please find the attached Invoices with date  

  

On Wed, Mar 27, 2024 at 5:46 AM Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Dear Priya 

  

Please mentioned PO dates along with number on all invoices. Ensure value should be as per PO shared..  

  

Extra work details need to be shared on PI excel format for further processing. 
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Note :- Shawarma, Burger & Masala Kitchen invoice??? 

  

Regards, 

Irfan 

  

From: Prifar Signs <prifarsignslucknow@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 26, 2024, 5:48 PM 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Signage Invoices 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Irfan,  

  

Please find the attached Invoices 
 

  

  
Thanks and Regards, 
  
PRIYA CHOWDHARY 
PRIFAR SIGNS 
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Lucknow 
7007107569  
  

 

 
 

  

--  

  
Thanks and Regards, 
  
PRIYA CHOWDHARY 
PRIFAR SIGNS 
Lucknow 
7007107569  
  

 
 
 
 
--  
 
Thanks and Regards, 
 
PRIYA CHOWDHARY 
PRIFAR SIGNS 
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Lucknow 
7007107569  
 

 


