Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: 31 July 2024 23:03

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO

Subject: RE: Performa Invoice for TFS HO Cubicle

Attachments: Performa Invoice TFS HO.pdf; PurchaseOrderPrinte9a713ca-da31-47aa-98d6-db1d8c2a84c2.pdf

Dear Nimisha,
Please review and process.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2024 4:09 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Performa Invoice for TFS HO Cubicle

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please find attached file for proforma invoice and work order copy.

Thanks & regards,

Pavan Sharma



M: +918097344059
M: +919699133757

Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information including
trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an intended
recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails are
susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If you
are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail deletion.
Thank you.



