Nimisha Jadhav

From: Khushbu Verma

Sent: Thursday, April 4, 2024 1:10 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Suraj Kumbhar; Ashish Nagar; Prakash Mistry

Subject: FW: CBTL MUMBAI 3RD STAGE BILL

Attachments: 2024-01 TFS SEMOLINA CBTL MUM 3RD STAGE_Scan.pdf

Dear Nimisha
PF enclosed invoice of proposed CBTL at Mum T1 Arrival. Plugd has shared GFC for same.

Regards
Khushbu

From: Finance Plugd <finance.plugd@gmail.com>

Sent: 03 April 2024 17:44

To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ritika <ritika@plugd.co.in>; PLUGD
<plugdworks@gmail.com>; sourabh <sourabh@plugd.co.in>

Subject: CBTL MUMBAI 3RD STAGE BILL

Some people who received this message don't often get email from finance.plugd@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Khushbu,

As per the discussion with Ritika Malik, we are sharing the Tax invoice against the 3rd stage of CBTL in Mumbai. For any information feel free to contact us.

Regards,



Team Finance@PLUGD

)

PLUGD

email: finance.plugd@gmail.com
contact: +91-99909 48535,
+91-99300 54118
address: 1st Floor, C-78, Sector-88, Noida - 201305



