Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S

Sent: Wednesday, February 7, 2024 11:29 AM

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shama Nair; ARROW ELECTRICAL; Sarvesh Patil; Trupti Dalvi
Subject: RE: LED Light bill @ KFC-UB BLR T2

Attachments: LED light bill.pdf

Dear Nimisha,
Please find attached herewith certified bill of Arrow electrical LED strip for KFC
Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: ARROW ELECTRICAL <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>

Sent: 06 February 2024 18:48

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: LED Light bill @ KFC-UB BLR T2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear sir,
Please find the attached wo and invoice bill for your approval.



Thanks & Regards,
ARROW Electrical's

Santosh Khake
9920431850



