Nimisha Jadhav

From: Urmila Jadhav

Sent: 05 September 2024 18:37

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Akshay Sharma; Irfan Sayed; Suraj Kumbhar; Divesh Tripathi; Shama Nair; Ameet.Koomar; Muskan Somani

Subject: RE: LKO-T3- Third Wave Coffee - A04 - 30% Remaining Bill of RA1 - JMR

Attachments: INVOICE VSAS-IN-24-25-23 Third Wave Coffee Furniture 30% Remaining bill 10-July-2024.pdf; A-04 Third wave Coffee FURNITURE

BOQ.xIsx; Final JMR Sheet.pdf

Dear Nimisha Mam,

Please find attached invoice (RA 02) of the furniture for LKN TWC outlet with supporting documents to proceed further.

Thanks & Regards,
Urmila Jadhav.

From: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 31 August 2024 15:51

To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Divesh Tripathi
<divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: LKO-T3- Third Wave Coffee - A04 - 30% Remaining Bill of RA1 - JMR

Dear Urmila

Please find attached balance 30% invoice for LKO-T3-Third Wave Coffee — A04.
Last time we have release 70% of payment for JMR done instead of 100%.

So kindly request you to process the balance 30% of the same asap.

Regards,



Irfan

From: Mohd Aslam <aslam.vsasgroup@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024, 6:25 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Divesh Tripathi <divesh.tripathi@semolinakitchens.com>; Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; vsasgroup@gmail.com
Subject: Re: A04 Third Wave Coffee 30% Remaining Bill

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan
Reminder for A04 Third Wave Coffee 30% Remaining Bill.
Kindly clear the remaining bill immediately.

Thanks & Regards
MOHD ASLAM
VSAS GROUP

On Sat, Aug 24, 2024 at 3:38 AM Mohd Aslam <aslam.vsasgroup@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Irfan
Reminder for A04 Third Wave Coffee 30% Remaining Bill.
Kindly process and clear remaining bills on an urgent basis.

Thanks & Regards
Mohd Aslam
VSAS Group

On Wed, Aug 21, 2024 at 11:48 PM Mohd Aslam <aslam.vsasgroup@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Irfan
Reminder for A04 Third Wave Coffee 30% Remaining Bill.




Kindly process and clear remaining bills ASAP.

Thanks & Regards
Mohd Aslam
VSAS Group

On Fri, Jul 26, 2024 at 3:55 PM Mohd Aslam <aslam.vsasgroup@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Irfan
Third Wave Coffee 30% Remaining Bill attached with JMR sheet

Ihonkee S Regarde

Mohd Aslam
VSAS Group



