Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 28 November 2024 12:12

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shadab Sukri

Subject: FW: FW: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi
Attachments: Invoice 25.pdf; TFSPL-PO-24-25-000492.pdf

Importance: High

Approved

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 28, 2024 10:27 AM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: anjlemepprojects@gmail.com

Subject: RE: FW: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi
Importance: High

Dear Sir,
Kindly approve attaché invoice to process further.

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: anjlemepprojects@gmail.com <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>

Sent: 21 November 2024 17:07

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: FW: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.




REGARDS

PREMKANT RAJPOOT

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14th YEAR COMPLETION

CIN NO-U74999DL2018PT(C333864

OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2N° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT
NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600 9871770191
Ext - 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecuritvy@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com

From: ANJLE OFFICE <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Sent: 20 July 2024 03:25 PM

To: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>;
Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Anjle Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: FW: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi

Dear Sir,

Kindly find the attached Tax Invoice of Split AC for Delhi Store.

THANKS & REGARDS



KIRAN GUPTA

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14" YEAR COMPLETION

OFFICE VENUE - 20/567 , 3*Y Floor DDA Flats Ambedakar Nagar
MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600, 9560072373

Ext — 31

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL

On Sat, Jul 20, 2024 at 2:55 PM <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com> wrote:

REGARDS

PREMKANT RAJPOOT

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14th YEAR COMPLETION

CIN NO-U74999DL2018PT(C333864
OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2°° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-41401600 9871770191



Ext - 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC , ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 03 July 2024 03:24 PM

To: PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; account.anjle@gmail.com

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle
Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>; Anjle Account Team <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi

Dear Sir,

Please find below utr .

Transaction

Transaction Date Transaction Description Amount
03/07/2024

13:18:03 FT - 0000000000163828 - 50200031745688 - ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 275216.00
03/07/2024

13:17:32 FT - 0000000000163634 - 50200031745688 - ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 42854.00
03/07/2024

13:17:32 FT - 0000000000163628 - 50200031745688 - ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 262985.00

Thanks & Regards,



Nimisha Jadhav.

From: PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>

Sent: 25 June 2024 17:24

To: account.anjle@gmail.com

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle
Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>; Anjle Account Team <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>; Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear priyanka,

Check and clear .

Regards



PREMKANT RAJPOOT

9871770191

ANIJLE MEP PROJECT PVT LTD

From: Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>

Date: 25/06/24 17:13 (GMT+05:30)

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>, "binu.balachandran" <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>, Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>, Anjle
Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>, PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>, Anjle Account Team <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Subject: RE: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi

Dear Madam,

Vendor ledger has open advance query.



Vendor Posting Document Open Due Document Original Ven
Code Vendor Name Date Type Advance Document No. External Doc. No. Date Date Amount

ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PRIVATE ADV/23- S50%SEMOLINA/PO/23- 21-03-

V000033 LIMITED 21-03-24 Payment YES 24/000803 24/000469/1 24 21-03-24 106970 | 30302
ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PRIVATE ADV/23- S50%SEMOLINA/PO/23- 21-03-

V000033 LIMITED 21-03-24 Payment YES 24/000805 24/000468/1 24 21-03-24 81820 | 30302
ADVBLR/23- 14-02-

V0001734 | ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14-02-24 Payment YES 24/00395 100%BLR/P0O/23-24/001871 24 14-02-24 65490 | 31101
BPDEL23- 14-02-

V0001734 | ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14-02-24 Payment YES 24/000495 S50%TFSPL/PO/23-24/000129 | 24 14-02-24 72685 | 31101

Regards,

Amit Upadhyay

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 25 June 2024 16:58
To: Amit Upadhyay <amit.upadhyay@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle
Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>; PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>; Anjle Account Team <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Subject: RE: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi
Importance: High

Dear Amit,

Kindly update advance status against below PO.



1) TFSPL/PO/24-25/000415

2) TFSPL/PO/24-25/000413.

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav.

From: PREMKANT RAJPOOT <anjlemepprojects@gmail.com>

Sent: 25 June 2024 16:42

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Anjle
Security <account.anjle@gmail.com>; Anjle Account Team <anjleoffice2008 @gmail.com>

Subject: Re: advance payment still not not received for extra work food hall INT and subway T 1 New Delhi

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Madam,



Advance payment is still not received as mentioned by Po pls check and release urgent.

1) TFSPL/PO/24-25/000415

2) TFSPL/PO/24-25/000413.

REGARDS
PREMKANT RAJPOOT

FOR ANJLE MEP PROJECTS PVT LTD 14th YEAR COMPLETION

CIN NO-U74999DL2018PT(C333864
OFFICE VENUE - 41/1407 , 2°° FLOOR DDA FLAT

MADANGIR NEAR KHANPUR RED LIGHT

NEW DELHI 110062 ,011-29968591 ,92 9871770191
Ext - 31

Mail id —anjlemepprojects@gmail.com, anjlesecurity@gmail.com

COMPLETED SOLUTION - FIRE, HVAC, ELECTRICAL , www.anjlemep.com




