Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 11 November 2024 11:42
To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shadab Sukri

Subject: FW: TACOBELL ELECTRICAL
Attachments: Taco Bell Electrical work.pdf

Dear Nimisha
Approved 85% for electrical work for TACOBELL

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 12:43 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra. sushant <sminfrasushant@gmail.com>;
Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; KRISHNA JHA <sminfra.krishna@gmail.com>; sminfra piyush <sminfrapiyush@gmail.com>; Shadab Sukri
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: TACOBELL ELECTRICAL

Dear Ajit,

Kindly review and approve for safal upload.

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.



From: KRISHNA JHA <sminfra.krishna@gmail.com>

Sent: 22 October 2024 16:07

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi
<manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra. sushant <sminfrasushant@gmail.com>; sminfra piyush <sminfrapiyush@gmail.com>
Subject: TACOBELL ELECTRICAL

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find attached file and make payment ASAP...



