Nimisha Jadhav

From: Urmila Jadhav

Sent: 19 October 2024 12:53

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Akshay Sharma; Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar; Ameet.Koomar; Stephen P; Pushpak Shewale; Santosh Tambe; Venkat Subramanian; Sabir Ali
Shah; Ebrahim Anis Shaikh; Muskan Somani

Subject: RE: RA1 Bill Lounge Work Trivandrum Kerala

Attachments: 30 Tax Invoice ( TRVD Lounge Work ) Shah Enterprises Mumbai.pdf; RA 1 BILL INT Lounge Work TRVD_2024-10-15.xlIsx; Plumbing trv-the

lounge signed copy (1).pdf; Hvac trv-the lounge signed copy (1).pdf; Electrical trv sing copy (1).pdf; Civil & interior (1).pdf, Work Order
Trivandrum International Lounge.pdf

Dear Nimisha Mam,

Please find attached invoice (RA 01) of the TRV lounge with supporting documents to proceed further.

Thanks & Regards,
Urmila Jadhav.

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 15 October 2024 13:53

To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>; Santosh Tambe
<santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Venkat Subramanian <trivandrum.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sabir Ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: RA1 Bill Lounge Work Trivandrum Kerla

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear All,

Find Attached the RA Bill supporting file please check and same



Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.

On Tue, Oct 15,2024 at 1:21 PM Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi,

Please share the abstract (In Excel) with summary & JMR (Pdf) for the same to proceed further.



Thanks & Regards,

Urmila Jadhav.

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 08 October 2024 14:56

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Venkat Subramanian
<trivandrum.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sabir Ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Ebrahim
Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Re: RA1 Bill Lounge Work Trivandrum Kerla

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear All,

Find attached the Tax invoice & supporting document please check process the payment

_Civil & interior (1).pdf




Electrical trv sing copy (1).pdf

_Hvac trv-the lounge signed copy (1).pdf

_Plumbing trv-the lounge signed copy (1).pdf

_RA 1 BILL Lounge Work TRVD..xls

Thanks & Regards,



4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.

On Mon, Oct 7, 2024 at 8:11 PM Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com> wrote:

Ok...plz go ahead.

Regards

Ebrahim

Get Outlook for Android




From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, October 7, 2024 6:22:55 PM

To: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale <pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>; Venkat Subramanian
<trivandrum.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sabir Ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Urmila
Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: RA1 Bill Lounge Work Trivandrum Kerla

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please approve the RA bill and then I will share the tax invoice

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.



On Sat, Oct 5, 2024 at 2:53 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team,
Please ignore the previous mail

Find attached the RA1 & Measurement sheet with signature please check and confirm ASAP.

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.



On Tue, Sep 24, 2024 at 5:24 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Find Attached RA1 Lounge Work Trivandrum Airport please check and confirm the same

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.






