Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh

Sent: 24 September 2024 13:43

To: Sabir Ali Shah; Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Anuj Dubey; Shama Nair; Stephen P; Pushpak Shewale
Subject: Re: Additional PCC work for TVD INT Lounge

Ok ...work has been completed. Please ho ahead
Ebrahim

Get Qutlook for Android

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2024 1:40:21 PM

To: Ebrahim Anis Shaikh <ebrahim.shaikh@semolinakitchens.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Pushpak Shewale
<pushpak.shewale@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Additional PCC work for TVD INT Lounge

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,

Reminder for NT PCC Work Invoice Payment

Thanks & Regards,



4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.
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On Tue, Sep 10, 2024 at 3:24 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear All,

Find Attached Tax Invoice for NT PCC Work Trivandrum please check and process the same

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,
Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,

India.
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