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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Karthick K
Sent: 03 August 2024 12:34
To: Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Ajit Yadav; binu.balachandran; Sabir ali Shah; Sabir Ali Shah; Anuj Dubey
Subject: RE: Related library rack final Bill Chennai international Airport lounge Po no TFSCPL/PO/23-24/000264

Hi Nimisha, 
 
Please proceed further.. 
 
 
Regards, 
Karthick 
 

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 03 August 2024 12:33 
To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sabir ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Sabir Ali 
Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Related library rack final Bill Chennai international Airport lounge Po no TFSCPL/PO/23-24/000264 
 
Dear Karthick . 
 
Kindly approve attached invoice  . 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Nimisha Jadhav. 
 
 
 

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>  
Sent: 03 August 2024 12:22 
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To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sabir ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Related library rack final Bill Chennai international Airport lounge Po no TFSCPL/PO/23-24/000264 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear All, 
 
I attached the final tax invoice library rack chennai  so please check and confirm 
 
 

Thanks & Regards,   

 

Modassir Wasim 

 

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall,  2nd Floor, Opp ozone,  

Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,  

India. 

 

 
 
On Mon, Jul 29, 2024 at 11:47 AM Sabir ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote: 
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Dear sir ,  
 
Library rack works has completed i didn't Claimed any Running bill for library rack that's why I am going to attached final bill for library rack Please check & 
Revert back to generate Invoice 
 
 
 
  
 
Thanks & Regards,  
Ejazul haque  
Project Engineer 
SHAH ENTERPRISES 


