Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: 06 December 2024 14:12

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: purple9 solutions; Binu Balachandran; Abdul Rehman

Subject: RE: Domestic Lounge Tax Invoice (Order no. 1121)

Attachments: Semolina Kitchens Tax Inv DEC 01.pdf; Semolina Kitchens E-Way Bill Agnst Tax Inv DEC 01.pdf; Delivery challans.rar

Dear Nimisha,
Please upload attached invoice in Safal.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: purple9 solutions <purple9solutions@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2024 8:20 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Subject: Domestic Lounge Tax Invoice (Order no. 1121)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir

Please find attached tax invoice, eway bill and delivery challans against order no. 1121

Regards

For PURPLE 9 SEATING SOLUTIONS,
Gala no. 1, Gupta Mills Estate

Devidayal Compound,



Near Britannia Factory,
Darukhana, Reay Road,
Mumbai - 400010
www.purple9.in
TEL: 9819816660




