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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Suraj Kumbhar
Sent: 01 October 2024 11:07
To: Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Shama Nair
Subject: FW: KOLKATA IRISH HOUSE & DOMESTIC LOUNGE INVOICE
Attachments: 2024-45 TFS KOLKATA DOMESTIC LOUNGE FINAL_Scan.pdf; 2024-46 TFS KOLKATA IRISH BAR FINAL_Scan.pdf

Hi Nimisha, 
 
Please process attached final invoices (50% of w/o amount) of PlugD vendor of Domestic Lounge and Irish Bar. 
 
Regards, 
Suraj Kumbhar 
 

From: Finance Plugd <finance.plugd@gmail.com>  
Sent: 01 October 2024 08:33 
To: Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: KOLKATA IRISH HOUSE & DOMESTIC LOUNGE INVOICE 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Suraj,   
 
As discussed we are sharing the full and final invoice for the Irish house and Domestic Lounge at Kolkata at 50%.  
Request you kindly process them. 
 
--  
Regards,  
 
Team Finance@PLUGD 

 You don't often get email from finance.plugd@gmail.com. Learn why this is important   
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email: finance.plugd@gmail.com 
contact: +91-99909 48535, 
              +91-99300 54118 
address: 1st Floor, C-78, Sector-88, Noida - 201305 


