Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: 05 December 2024 18:10

To: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav

Subject: RE: MALS/PO/24-25/000044
Attachments: 054 MALS Domestic Lounge Invoice.pdf

Dear Nimisha,
Please upload invoice.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2024 6:06 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: MALS/PO/24-25/000044

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find the attached file for Tax Invoice for processing, Einvoice will be shared as soon as possible.
Thanks & regards,

Pavan Sharma



M: +918097344059
M: +919699133757

Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information including
trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an intended
recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails are
susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If you
are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail deletion.
Thank you.

On Thu, Dec 5, 2024 at 5:51 PM Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Pavan,

Please share invoice.

Regards,

Shashank Mahadik

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2024 4:04 PM




To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: MALS/PO/24-25/000044

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find PI for the same. Please give approval for raising the invoice.
Thanks & regards,

Pavan Sharma

M: +918097344059



M: +919699133757

Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information
including trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an
intended recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails
are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If
you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail
deletion. Thank you.

On Thu, Dec 5, 2024 at 3:34 PM Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Pavan,

Please raise Invoice with below corrections.

1. Theline item of Fabric to be kept separate in Invoice at last

2. Transport cost to be reviewed based on reduced scope

Regards,

Shashank Mahadik



From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2024 1:38 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: MALS/PO/24-25/000044

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir/Ma'am,

Please find attached files for lounge chair refurbishment work.

Fabric for sofa procured :
446+75+212+36=769
Utilised :

117+64=181

Balance 769-181=588

Thanks & regards,

Pavan Sharma



M: +918097344059

M: +919699133757

Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information
including trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an
intended recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails
are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If

you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail
deletion. Thank you.



