Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 20 June 2024 16:28

To: sminfra.krishna@gmail.com

Cc: Shadab Sukri; Prabhat Kumar; Nimisha Jadhav; sminfra piyush; Delhi Project; Prabhat Kumar; Nimisha Jadhav
Subject: FW: KFC MS

Attachments: KFC MS.pdf

Approved 60% for MS work for KFC please share the invoice

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: KRISHNA JHA <sminfra.krishna@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 3:51 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>
Subject: KFC MS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find attached file and check KFC MS RA



