Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shama Nair

Sent: 05 November 2024 12:37

To: Ranjandas S

Cc: Suraj Kumbhar; Nimisha Jadhav; Intercare Enterprises
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-TFS-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-2
Approved

Regards,

Shama Nair

+91 9821053476
http://www .k-hospitality.com/

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Sent: 05 November 2024 11:09

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Intercare Enterprises
<info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: BLR-T1-TFS-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-2

Dear Shama,

Request to approve and release the payment by this week. There is few materials is very critical like stainless steel, grid ceiling, marble vendors payment .
Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,
BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,



Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2024 10:44 am

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: BLR-T1-TFS-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ranjandas Sir,

Please find the attachment revised Invoice bill no 20 for BLR-080

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.
Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820485192

On Tue, Nov 5, 2024 at 10:18 AM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote:

Dear Takbir,

Please check the billing address



3:; Name Of Company ﬁ;ar:‘ee Branch Name | GST Number Nature of Location Detailed address of location
1 | Travel Food Services Private Limited | Karnataka | BLR- T1 29AADCB2762L1ZE | Lounge & Transit Hotel | | &rminal 1, Administration Block, Ke

Urban, Karnataka, 560300

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2024 6:01 pm

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: BLR-T1-TFS-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ranjandas sir,



Please find the attachment 2nd Ra bill for BLR-080 ph2,

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820485192

On Mon, Nov 4, 2024 at 4:00 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in> wrote:

Dear Shama,

Please find attached herewith the certified copy of Intercare 2" RA for your approval.

Dear Takbir,

Please accept and submit the tax invoice.



Dear Suraj,

We are in critical stage of project and please arrange to release this payment by this week.

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.



