Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S

Sent: 30 September 2024 13:48

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shama Nair

Subject: RE: BLR-T1-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-1

Dear Nimisha,
OK. Please proceed. Please check the billing address. They revised as per new instruction.
Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, 30 September 2024 1:10 pm

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: BLR-T1-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-1

Dear Sir,

Kindly provide approval on attached bill to upload on safal.

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.



From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>

Sent: 30 September 2024 12:55

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: BLR-T1-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-1

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Nimisha mam,

Please find attached the invoice for BLR-080 Lounge (Attachment: Ra-01 bill). I kindly request you to process and release the payment at your
earliest convenience.

If you need any further details or clarification, please don't hesitate to reach out.

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.
Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820485192

On Mon, Sep 30, 2024 at 11:34 AM Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Nimisha,

Please take it forward



Regards,
Shama Nair
+91 9821053476
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From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Sent: Monday, September 30, 2024 9:56 AM

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises(@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: BLR-T1-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-1

Dear Shama,

Signed copy.

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,
Project Incharge,



BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Ranjandas S

Sent: Monday, 30 September 2024 9:22 am

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises(@gmail.com>
Subject: BLR-T1-080 Lounge ph-2 Intercare RA-1

Dear Shama,

Please find attached herewith the certified bill of Intercare enterprises RA-1 for your approval.

Dear Nimisha,

Please arrange to get the tax invoice, approval and arrange the payment.

Dear Takbir,

Please submit the tax invoice after approval of bill.



Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.



