Nimisha Jadhav

From: Suraj Kumbhar

Sent: 05 December 2024 18:20

To: Ranjandas S; Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Shama Nair

Subject: RE: Request for Review and Approval of RA-3 Bill BLR-080 PH2
Hi Nimisha,

Please process..
@Ranjan sir, as discussed on call, kindly ensure that all non-tender items are removed from the next bill & Please initiate a separate PR/PO for these non-tender items.

Regards,
Suraj Kumbhar

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 05 December 2024 15:24

To: Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Request for Review and Approval of RA-3 Bill BLR-080 PH2

Dear Suraj,

Kindly review and confirm for safal upload.

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: 04 December 2024 14:49




To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Review and Approval of RA-3 Bill BLR-080 PH2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Randas sir,

Please find the Attachment Tax invoice bill

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.
Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820089075

On Wed, Dec 4, 2024 at 2:15 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Takbir,

Please find attached herewith the certified copy of RA-3. Please arrange to submit the Tax invoice asap.

Dear Suraj,

Please inform accounts to keep the budget. We have to release this by this by Friday. There are few deliverables depending on payment.
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Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

Travel Food Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2024 5:19 pm

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Review and Approval of RA-3 Bill BLR-080 PH2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ranjandas Sir,

Please find attached the revised bills for RA-1, RA-2, and RA-3. The adjustments have been made to address the quantity differences between
the respective stages, and the calculations are as follows:

1. RA-1 vs RA-2: The gross amount of RA-2 has been adjusted by deducting the gross amount of RA-1, resulting in the actual amount for
RA-2.

2. RA-2 vs RA-3: Similarly, the gross amount of RA-3 has been adjusted by deducting the gross amount of RA-2, resulting in the actual
amount for RA-3.



Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820089075

On Tue, Nov 26, 2024 at 4:47 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Ranjan sir,

Kindly look into how we can process this accordingly .

Minimum

SrNo | Name UOM |Qty | , ot Unit Price Amount RA-1 RA-2
NOS | 1 5,79,13,844|Qty (% |Amount |Qty (% |Amount
Civil Interior
1.1 18 mm thick Italian Marble flooring Smt | 190 ## 10,795 20,51,050| 190(40%)| 8,20,420 | 201.46 {85% 18,48,529




Flooring shall consist of Marble as per drawing, At

least 50 mm thk bedding mortar in 1 4 ratio, At least 18
mm thk marble to be fixed in white cement only, Marble
shall be mirror polished, Marble to be cut as per size and
laid with tight hairline joints, Joints to be filled Joint
sealant, matching to marble in TIM-X or equivalent joint
filler, including approved sealer to be applied on all sides,
with edge polish etc., complete, Including using plastic
Pvc sheet and POP to protect on marble

flooring as protection , Include removal and disposing of
protection materials before handover, Basic cost of
marble Rs 450 sft

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

Travel Food Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2024 2:42 pm

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Request for Review and Approval of RA-3 Bill BLR-080 PH2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.




Dear Ranjan sir ,

Kindly look into how we can process this accordingly .

Minimum . .
Sr.No |1 o m Name UOM | Qty| oo unt | Unit Price Amount RA-1 RA-2
RA-2 Gross |RA-2 Actua
[\ o
y _ NOS | 1 57913844/ Qty (% |Amount |Qty (% [\ ¢ Amout
Civil Interior
1.1 [18 mm thick Italian Marble flooring Smt [ 190 ## 10,795 20,51,050( 190(40%| 8,20,420 | 201.46 [85% 18,48,529 10,28,1

Flooring shall consist of Marble as per drawing,
At least 50 mm thk bedding mortar in 1 4 ratio,
At least 18 mm thk marble to be fixed in white
cement only, Marble shall be mirror polished,
Marble to be cut as per size and laid with tight
hairline joints, Joints to be filled Joint sealant,
matching to marble in TIM-X or equivalent joint
filler, including approved sealer to be applied on
all sides, with edge polish etc., complete,
Including using plastic Pvc sheet and POP to
protect on marble flooring as protection ,
Include removal and disposing of protection
materials before handover, Basic cost of marble
Rs 450 sft

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises

Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,



Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820089075

On Tue, Nov 26, 2024 at 2:27 PM Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ranjan Sir,

As per your request to consolidate the RA-1, RA-2, and RA-3 bills into a single page, I seek your guidance on the following matter:

In RA-1, the BOQ quantity is 190 sqm. However:

o RA-2reflects an actual quantity of 201 sqm.
o RA-3 also shows 201 sqm.

I am unsure how to calculate and represent the percentage adjustments across RA-1, RA-2, and RA-3 to meet the required format. Could you
kindly suggest the best approach for this

Minimum

Sr.No Item Name UOM | Qty |, - int | UnitPrice Amount RA-1
Civil Interior NOS [ 1 5,79,13,844 (Qty [% | Amount
1.1 18 mm thick Italian Marble flooring Smt | 190 ## 10,795 20,51,050 190 |40%| 8,20,420

Flooring shall consist of Marble as per drawing, At least 50 mm thk bedding mortar
in 1 4 ratio, At least 18 mm thk marble to be fixed in white cement only, Marble
shall be mirror polished, Marble to be cut as per size and laid with tight hairline joints,
Joints to be filled Joint sealant, matching to marble in TIM-X or equivalent joint filler,
including approved sealer to be applied on all sides, with edge polish etc., complete,
Including using plastic Pvc sheet and POP to protect on marble

flooring as protection , Include removal and disposing of protection materials before
handover, Basic cost of marble Rs 450 sft

Thanks & Regards,



Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820089075

On Tue, Nov 26, 2024 at 1:44 PM Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Bill should be RA-1, RA-2 & Ra-3 format

Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

Travel Food Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.

From: Intercare Enterprises <info.intercareenterprises@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2024 1:32 pm

To: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Subject: Request for Review and Approval of RA-3 Bill BLR-080 PH2




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ranjandas Sir,

Kindly find attached the RA-3 Bill for BLR-080 Phase 2 for your review. I request you to check and approve the bill at your earliest
convenience.

Thanks & Regards,

Shaikh Takbir Ahammed | Project Manager

Intercare Enterprises
Plot No — 51, Diama Road, Kherwadi,
Bandra (East), Mumbai — 400 051.

Mobile : +91 9167593786 1 9820089075



