Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 24 April 2024 23:47

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Subject: RE: DELHI TWC Supporting Documents
Attachments: FW: DELHI TWC Supporting Documents
Approved

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 24 April 2024 06:01 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: DELHI TWC Supporting Documents

Dear Sir,
Kindly approve attached invoice to upload on safal .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 24 April 2024 16:28

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: DELHI TWC Supporting Documents

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Ma'am
I have attached the supporting Document so please check

Thanks & Regards
Modassir Wasim



