Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 18 May 2024 15:56

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Ajit Singh

Subject: RE: DEL Budweiser ( Structure )
Attachments: FW: DEL Budweiser ( Structure )
Approved

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 18 May 2024 03:14 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: DEL Budweiser ( Structure )

Dear Sir,
Kindly approve attached invoice .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 13 May 2024 12:32

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>;
Anuj Dubey <anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar
Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: DEL Budweiser ( Structure )




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,
I have attached the tax invoice of Structure of budweiser delhi so please check & process the payment

Thanks & Regards
Modassir Wasim



