Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: 21 March 2024 14:11

To: santosh khake

Cc: Ranjandas S

Subject: FW: BLR-T2-TFS-IRISH HOUSE FINAL BILL
Attachments: Final bill of Arrow ele of Irish house PO661.pdf
Dear sir,

Kindly share tax invoice as per certified invoice .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ranjandas S <Ranjandas.s@blrlounge.in>

Sent: Thursday, March 21, 2024 1:56 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; ARROW ELECTRICAL <project.arrowelectricals@gmail.com>; Santosh Khake <khakesantosh10@gmail.com>
Subject: BLR-T2-TFS-IRISH HOUSE FINAL BILL

Dear Nimisha,
Please find attached herewith the certified copy of Irish house electrical works to process further..
Thanks & Regards,

Ranjandas Shetty,

Project Incharge,

BLR Lounge Services Private Limited,
Kempegowda International Airport,
Devanahalli, Bengaluru,

Karnataka 560300. © +91 - 9663778877.



