Nimisha Jadhav

From: Prakash Mistry

Sent: 22 April 2024 18:13

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Stephen P

Subject: RE: Invoices for Ahmadabad Airport

Approved , Please proceed

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, April 22, 2024 4:26 PM

To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Subject: FW: Invoices for Ahmadabad Airport

Dear Prakash,

Kindly review and approve attached invoice .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav

From: Amit <bk.oipl@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 22, 2024 12:34 PM

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Genesis Arch <navjot@genarch.in>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Invoices for Ahmadabad Airport

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.




Hi Nimisha,
Please update the payment status.

Regards,
Amit

On Fri, Apr 12, 2024 at 12:33 PM Amit <bk.oipl@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,
We haven't yet received the payment.
Request you to please update the status.

Regards,
Amit
NSA Design Studio

On Thu, Mar 14, 2024 at 5:38 PM Amit <bk.oipl@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,
Please find attached final invoices for the outlets listed below:

e KFC (FF SHA FC)

e Idli.com

e Nourish

e Dhaba

e KFC (Arrival forecourt)
e Third wave coffee

Request you to review and do the needful to initiate the payment process.

Regards,

Amit

NSA Design Studio
7428376207






