Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: 25 April 2024 17:03

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Subject: FW: T1 080 Kannada signage - PO-BLR/PO/23-24/000061- Due Amount
Attachments: Tax Inv_012_TFS_ BLR_T1_Kannada_&_English_Sign.pdf

Dear Nimisha,
Please process attached invoice.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: Marcon Finance Vinod <marconfinance@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 25, 2024 4:45 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>; Jogeswar Sahu
<jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Marcon Signage <marcondisplay@gmail.com>; Projects 1 <Projects@marconsignage.com>; Jitesh Popat
<jitesh@marconsignage.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>;
procuresens@safalsoftcom.com; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-
corp.in>

Subject: Re: T1 080 Kannada signage - PO-BLR/PO/23-24/000061- Due Amount

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Shashank and Mr. Jogeswar
As discussed yesterday, please find attached is the Tax Invoice to release another 20% amount.

Please release 20% advance payment.

Regards,
Vinod Dayma M: +91-98209 73657
Finance Head E: marconfinance@gmail.com

Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd
M ‘ ‘ Hc Marcon Display Solutions
_ Mumbai, India.
Bespoke Signage !

Wwww.marconsignage.com

| (il o

NOTE : OUR company Name Changed From MARCON DIGIPRINTS PYTLTD 70 MARCON SIGNAGE PVT LTD.

On Mon, Apr 22, 2024 at 2:39 PM Marcon Finance Vinod <marconfinance@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Mr. Shashank,

Please find attached is the PI for 20% advance.



Regards,

Vinod Dayma M: +91-98209 73657
Finance Head E: marconfinance@gmail.com

Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd
M ‘ ‘ Hc Marcon Display Solutions
Mumbai, India.

Bespoke Signage !

WWww.marconsignage.com

| (il o

NOTE : OUR company Name Changed From MARCON DIGIPRINTS PYTLTD 70 MARCON SIGNAGE PVT LTD.

On Mon, Apr 22, 2024 at 1:35 PM Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>
wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please share Pl of 20% amount to release the additional payment.

Regards,

Shashank Mahadik

From: Marcon Finance Vinod <marconfinance@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 22,2024 1:26 PM

To: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>
Cc: Marcon Signage <marcondisplay@gmail.com>; Shashank Mahadik
<shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>; Projects 1 <Projects@marconsignage.com>; Jitesh Popat
<jitesh@marconsignage.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>;
procuresens@safalsoftcom.com; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: T1 080 Kannada signage - PO-BLR/PO/23-24/000061- Due Amount

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Mr. Sarvesh,



As discussed in a meeting earlier on dated April 4, 2024, request you to please arrange the 20% payment
before delivery.

BLR LOUNGE SERVICES PVT. LTD

BLR/P0O/23-24/000061/080 Lounge, Transit Hotel - Eng, Logo & Kanda Sign (PO-061) 895,000

Looking forward to receipt of the above due payment.

Regards,
\(inod Dayma M: +91-98209 73657
Finance Head E: marconfinance@gmail.com

M “! Hc Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd
Marcon Display Solutions

Bespoke Signage {| wumbai, india.

www.marconsignaqe.com

ERlE

NOTE : OUR company Name Changed From MARCON DIGIPRINTS PVT LTD TO MARCON SIGNAGE PVT LTD.

On Fri, Apr 5, 2024 at 4:32 PM Marcon Finance Vinod <marconfinance@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Jogeswar Sahu,

As discussed yesterday in a meeting at worli, request you to please change the address of our Company
as follows:



Marcon Signavt Ltdge P

6A, NISHITH, Croft Lane, Off S V Road,
Santacruz West, Mumbai 400 054

Please share the revised PO with the above address.

Regards

Vinod Dayma M: +91-98209 73657
Finance Head E: marconfinance@gmail.com

M “‘ Rc Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd
Marcon Display Solutions

Bespoke Signage {| wyumbai, idia.

www.marconsignage.com

| lid

NOTE : OUR company Name Changed From MARCON DIGIPRINTS PyTLTD 70 MARCON SIGNAGE PVT LTD.

On Tue, Apr 2, 2024 at 1:38 PM Marcon Finance Vinod <marconfinance@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team TFS,

We received an attached PO No. BLR/PO/23-24/000061 and there are some corrections as follows :

1. Kindly correct our address as :
Marcon Signage Pvt Ltd

6A, NISHITH, Croft Lane, Off S V Road,
Santacruz West, Mumbai 400 054

2. Terms of Payment: 70% advance, balance on delivery

4



3. MSME: Our MSME certificate 1s attached herewith

Regards,

Vinod Dayma

M: +91-98209 73657
Finance Head

E: marconfinance@gmail.com

M “‘ Rc Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd

. Marcon Display Solutions
Bespoke Signage {|  yumbai, india.

www.marconsignage.com

| lid

NOTE : OUR company Name Changed From MARCON DIGIPRINTS PyTLTD 70 MARCON SIGNAGE PVT LTD.

On Fri, Mar 29, 2024 at 4:26 PM Jitesh Popat <jitesh(@marconsignage.com> wrote:

Hello,

PFA herewith the 2nd PDF...BLR International Lounge-Vertical line length reduced (also note
there will be a 12.5 mm border on the front-all 4 sides)

Jitesh Popat

' - M: +91-9820121431
Managing Director

+91-9820221431
E: jitesh@marconsignage.com
jiteshpopat@icloud.com
MAHDON Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd.

Bespoke Signage Solutions Marcon Display Solutions

Mumbai, India.

MEMBER

www.marconsignage.com




On Fri, Mar 29, 2024 at 4:12 PM Jitesh Popat <jitesh@marconsignage.com> wrote:

Hello Mr. Chetan,

Thanks, as discussed, PFA herewith a PDF giving the details of the 1st signage. (existing
signage-Proposed signage -input received from your end)

Jitesh Popat

' - M: +91-9820121431
Managing Director

+91-9820221431
E: jitesh@marconsignage.com
jiteshpopat@icloud.com
MAHGDN Marcon Signage Pvt. Ltd.

Bespoke Signage Solutions Marcon Display Solutions

Mumbai, India.

MEMBER

www.marconsignage.com

f in]®

On Fri, Mar 29, 2024 at 12:37 PM Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hello Mr Jitesh,

Attached is the print file of the Lounges & Transit Hotels Signages.



Regards,

Chetan V Bobade

9004933151

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Shiv Sagar Estate, A-Block, 1st Floor, Dr. Annie Besant Road,

Worli, Mumbai-400018.

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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